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Open Forum/ Announcements:  

Billy B. from Principles before personalities: Brought up concerns about 
violent and disruptive members. Tim G. (Area Sec.) referred to NA Lit. on 
the subject. Cindy shared experience strengths and hop, as did Gary and 
another addict.  

  

Sandy from Recovery by the books: The church which hosts ASC, H&I, 
FDC as well as several meetings was vandalized by an unknown person or 
persons (not NA members) and her HG thinks that though it is not our fault 
and even though the damage has been repaired that we should offer a 
gesture of good faith to the church ie a clean-up or some other form of 
service. Tony shared experience strength and hope on being of service to 
the community, Kevin suggested individual group contributions, Tony 
clarified that every group has their own responsibility to the community, but 
other parts of the service structure meet here and it would be a nice 



gesture to offer service in general. Rafael from Just for today shared 
experience strength and hope and Mike B. suggested Tony handle an ad 
hoc group to ask the church if they need our service. 

  

Old/ Current Business:  

Secretary Report 

We apologize for the minutes being late. 

New Business: None 

Situations and Changes: None 

  

RCM Report

Old /Current /New Business: 9 BT soft covers were donated for behind 
the walls meetings, please continue to bring your donations to area. No 
region this month, next region on 9/19 in Safety Harbor. 

: 

  

Situations and Changes: None 

  

FDC:

Learning day workgroup was formed, Paula will be heading up the group. 
Please contact her if you wish to become involved. As of now the 
coordinator from each resource will be involved on it as well as there being 
a online page for staying involved. 

   

  

Fran M was voted in as PR Coordinator. Arnold has the willingness to stay 
on to train Fran. 



  

Still in need of a Co-Chair of FDC. 

  

Old/Current Business: Raised $537.00 ($137.00 above cost) with beach 
bash, 150 in attendance.Activities has raised $760.45 YTD.  

Activities: 

New Business: Planning Marathon meetings for the holidays and a large 
event for New Years Eve 

Situations and Changes: Needs support next meeting is 10-14-15 6pm at 
Starbucks on University and Tuttle. 

  

Old/Current Business: Approved flier for frontline 

Policy: 

New Business:  You can email flyers to policy@suncoastna.org  

Situations/Changes: 

  

Old/ Current Business: Absent 

GSR O&M: 

New Business: Absent 

Situations /Changes: Absent 

  

Literature: 

mailto:policy@suncoastna.org�


Old/Current Business: $2577.11 spent, all back orders filled. Please 
make sure names are on Lit orders  

New Business: None 

Situations/Changes: None 

  

Treasurer’s Report:

  

 Absent represented by Alt 

PR:

  

 Probation 6th Ave Bradenton - waiting for manatee glens o/p James 
XXXX approved to all literature def. for 8/9/15 waiting del. lit. on 
presentation left lit date. Did not contact phoneline in an effort to keep 
continXXXXXX this is important. 

Centerstone

(Had trouble reading this did the best I could) 

 -   Manatee Glens main campus for presentation left lit. 
Manatee glens OX 6th presentation James XXXXXX. ISU waiting fXXX s. 
XXXX field for date pres. to PA. Suncoast BXX HXX met X given to 
H&IXXXX XXXXSCF met X asst, Debra Harr for approval debXXX XXXX 
Blake Hosp. Mkt Dep letter to Kelly XXXXXXXXXXXX Big brother & Sisters 
left lit called Venice office X XXXX. Probation 6th ave manatee left lit to 
about pres  ShetXXXX. LECOM LWR presentation XXXXX 10/24. XXX 
memXXXXXX XXXXXX manager waiting call. Follow up on presentation, 
will continue to deliver into in Sara Devin Bradenton FrXX LWR. Mock 
presentations I will stay on and help Fran particularly with presentations 
that require the PR presentation apparatuses.  

  

  

  

  



12 O’clock Clean: Admission of Defeat: No Changes 

Group Reports: 

Atmosphere of Recovery: No Changes 

Basic Text Study: 

28 years, Rick O. November 10th  

Anniversary 

Call Group:  No Changes  

Eastside Recovery: No Changes 

Fresh Start Group: No Changes  

Friday Night Clean: Annual Christmas party in the works, more will be 
revealed. 

Friday Night Lights: No Changes 

Frontline Group:  meets Tuesday 7-8 at OLQM now serving hotdogs and 
sodas. Picnic will be Oct 17th  

Girls Gone Good: No Changes  

High Hopes: No Changes 

Just for Today: No Changes  

Keep it Simple: No Changes 

Keeping it Green: Group might be moving, if so the GSR will contact 
phone line and Web to let them know.  

Life Boat Group: Anniversary 

Living Clean: No Changes  

– Date not 
specified                                               
                                                                   1 year, Lyle G.  

Men’s Meeting: No Changes 



More Gratitude Less Attitude: Anniversaries:

18 mos. Jon S. 11/16 

        

18 mos. Hanna T. 11/18  

Never Alone: increased participation, soon to elect trusted servants, 
potential GSR in the making  

  

  

  

  

New Beginnings YPG: Meets at Siesta Key Chapel Sunday 7-
8pm Speaker 2nd Sunday  

New Directions: No Changes 

No Matter What Club: No Changes 

Peace in the Morning:   

Anniversaries

18 mos. Lyle  

 – Dates not specified 

1 yr. Michelle 

2 yrs. Trent  

Principles B4 Personalities: No Changes  

Recovery by the Books: No Changes 

Saturday Night Speaker: Looking for speakers, call Tim G. 941-580-2337 

Serenity in the Morning: No Changes 



Solution Revolution: new Alt GSR - Kris. 

Solution in the Steps: No Changes 

Tradition Twelve:  meets at Church of the Cross Tuesday 8-9pm needs 
support every 4th Tuesday is a speaker. 

Unity and Serenity: No Changes 

Waves of Recovery: No Changes 

We Do Recover: No Changes   

The Wednesday Meeting: No Changes 

Wednesday Night Bonfire: No Changes/ 

Women in Recovery: Anniversaries

5 yrs. Jessica A. 8/2/2010 

 –  

1 yr. Kathy A. 8/28/2014 

3 yrs. Emily P. 7/6/2012 

Women’s Perspective: No Changes 

Work the Steps or Die: No Changes 

  

No Motions 

ASC MOTION:  

  

Elections:

  

  



The following positions still need filled please bring nominations to next 
ASC: 

need nominations for all  ALTERNATES 


